
Johnson HVACR & Foodservice Equipment
d/b/a Johnson Mechanical Service, Inc. I Shearer Electric

1820 Riverway Dr.
Pekin, IL 61554

Invoice 137144

’eit./Sg2~

JOHNSON* HVACR 8. FOODSERVICE EQUIPMENTPh: 309-346-3434 Fax: 309-346-1923

www.johnsonfoodsDrvico.com

Ship To / Job Location:Bill To:

Morton Junior High School'
225 E Jackson

Morton, IL61550

Morton CUSD #709'
1050 South Fourth Ave
Suite 200
Morton, IL 61550

Please remit payment to: Johnson Mechanical Service, Inc., 1820 Riverway Dr., Pekin, IL 61554

Rep I CierkWork Order Purchase OrderInvoice Date Terms Due Date

SCOTTNET 30 1276355/20/20214/20/2021

Unit Price AmountQTY Description

Miscellaneous

$73,75 $73.751.00 CAstor
Notes:

UtSCR: are p3-4 (:■ at d-a^»v-s. rtp4<. Ktckrch, part AC9HV%on trd c7i*t |c^relAted tJtks LAbci on nvoovs wJ icSect Ev»fy
ivJ c r to e cna ww k rt a tme^ mArrt«r ■ Subtotal

-I- Sales Tax
$73.75

$0.00
V/SA

V.lSC. SUPPLIES: bt4 net l.-rktriJ l». (^ep rw>r«J aHOMS. 4isn. vtiAt did bs, >*^e ccnrteeivt. fa>(er4fs. 9a iMl
tecais ar>d ttptac«cnenc ba'ei^a. aaAlAnta. Up«. «ts

StiiPPlSOi'HAKOUtfO; ii>c»jd«f irpm auppiats (otfep a1 7^a itamt ac us«. arvj funding eixi«n>et ts meatch, cider, iec«r/e ar>3 ce^tcck those ^ems
$73.75

$0.00
Invoice TotalTRUCK CtlARGE: mcbjJes aO assocoied ce»R kr epereiiyi of tech v«hicf« luch at fuel, oi che.nge*. cnair.ieYiAhce, repaz. monTify kd&e. rlereat depreoatczi. IcenMig. napecMm.

4i'J re<^ar4> ".3a
Payments

LIMITED WARRANTY; A/ rnatetij's. pO'ts. and e^j P'*:ert 6’t wstrdiUic J try the manjtce&/er>* «r euppiietc wrzierk wsrrAnty enty. AJ labor perTocmed by Jchrsen Metfiaraeal ServKe
ijM$) s warranted for 30 a.tyt or aa otherwise ziyirvtj jMS mekeerxi OTkt wanantiei, eiprets orimpled. and Fa agenta ct techniciaria are riot authcrjed to make erryajjch
«j'rar“«on oena fof JMS Total Due $73.75
IM PC RTANT IN FO Rf/ATI ON ■ Paa 101
thi$ cscu're' 1 iXi bena'1 o> our oustomer lr^ Ui« e<er.i of tic«i payrnrni. cuatomer og>e«> to be held fraocia:ly noMo for any and all ccDecticn feea. reaaonable aiierney feea end eauil

r:eceasd<y icr colectng any JeLt orcmreO for gaoda or service oat paid aa Agreed in ad^ton, customer agrees to the release of any nacessaty account knformai»on
to a Dvid-DOity co>:ectiC4i agency iT neeeasAiy for cotectuig sucri oebt. Tha rciaosa aubnentation wiO rcmor ai efoci unU rcvcked by you, V* customer, ai writing.

ly Le charijcO «i5etc*i ui 1 5% per month (10% APR) 6y ycor vgrvjtjie below, you acknowledge that you are euthorued to sign.ounta

costs thatLe'-i

Customer Signature Printed Name Date Job Title

We now accent chocks by fax and email. Save postage and avoid mail delays.
Send a digital copy of your signed check to us and retain the original.

Fax to 309-346-1923 or email to jmoe@jmsinc.net



Zimmerman, Amy <amy.zimmerman@mcusd709.org>

Re: [STAFF] Johnson Mechanical 137144 
1 message

Schuck, Rodney <rodney.schuck@mcusd709.org> Tue, Apr 27, 2021 at 2:54 PM
To: "Zimmerman, Amy" <amy.zimmerman@mcusd709.org>

2540.451.3- Approved

On Tue, Apr 27, 2021 at 2:37 PM Zimmerman, Amy <amy.zimmerman@mcusd709.org> wrote: 
Please review for approval - 2540.451.05 
 
       
Have an Amazing & Blessed day!  
Amy Zimmerman 
MCUSD Business Office Assistant / Accounts Payable
1050 S. Fourth Ave. Ste. 200 * Morton, IL 61550
PH: (309) 284-8070  Fax: (309) 266-6320 email:Amy.Zimmerman@MCUSD709.org
 
Some days you just have to create your own sunshine     
 

mailto:amy.zimmerman@mcusd709.org
https://www.google.com/maps/search/1050+S.+Fourth+Ave.+Ste.+200+*%C2%A0+Morton,%0D%0AIL+61550+%0D%0A%0D%0A+PH:%0D%0A(309?entry=gmail&source=g

